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Introduction
Stress is one of the most powerful causal predictors of various

psychopathologies, and the role of stress is highlighted in most
theoretical reports on the cause and permanence of
psychopathological disorders. Nevertheless, it is increasingly
understood that there are significant differences in individual
susceptibility and responsiveness to stress. In addition, there are
now many signs that some people become more and more
sensitive over time. These common processes of stress
sensitivity and stress sensitization have a profound effect on
understanding individual differences in the risk of developing
and maintaining psychopathology. Feeling anxiety, sadness, and
discouragement is a universal experience of meeting almost
everyone from time to time. Such emotional reactions are within
the normal range of human function and are common reactions
to adverse situations such as preparing for difficult interviews,
failing important exams, dismissing, or losing a loved one. In
fact, these emotional responses are adaptive in that they help
prioritize goals, communicate emotions, and remember
important life events. However, in some cases, emotional
responses to stressful situations can be exaggerated or
protracted; leading to stress that affects social and professional
functioning. In these situations, stress can contribute to the
development of various forms of psychopathology. Certain
disorders known to be induced by stress include social anxiety
disorder, generalized anxiety disorder, post-traumatic stress
disorder, substance abuse disorder, schizophrenia, bipolar
disorder, and major depressive disorder. Includes failures. Stress
can also contribute to the development of personality disorders
such as characteristics such as antisocial personality disorder
and borderline personality disorder, especially if the stress
exposure is long-term or severe. In this article, the types of

stress that cause psychopathology, the susceptibility factors that
contribute to individual differences in stress responsiveness, the
mechanisms that link stress to psychopathology, and the
underlying link between stress, psychopathology, and physical
illness. Describes the process of Psychological stress is a major
problem and can cause a variety of health problems, including
psychopathology such as depression and anxiety. The stress and
coping transaction model is an established model that
conceptualizes stressful experiences through the relationship
between humans and the environment. This cross-sectional
study focuses on self-criticism and confidence of Czech students
suffering from a high prevalence of mental health problems,
from stress to depression. The purpose was to find out the way
to anxiety. A convenient sample of 119 students completed the
form of a depression anxiety and stress scale 21 and a self-
criticism attack and self-reliance scale. Correlation and path
analysis were performed. Guidelines for enhancing the reporting
of observational studies in epidemiology have been used to
support accurate and complete reporting of studies. Depression,
anxiety, and stress are positively associated with self-deficiency
and hatred, and negatively associated with mild self. Inadequate
and disliked self-mediated partial stress-depression and stress-
anxiety relationship, while mild self-mediated partial stress-
depression relationship. Insufficiency had a greater impact on
the stress-depression anxiety pathway than hating and calming
oneself. The results suggest that clinical treatment may benefit
from targeting inadequate sensations to prevent stress from
turning into psychopathology. This is especially relevant as stress
levels are increasing around the world. Our results provide
further development of the transaction model and help
practitioners and educators find solutions to protect the mental
health of Czech college students.
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